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The reader, if he follows diligently the instructions that I will give him, will be able in a short time to
astonish his numerous friends with his acquired knowledge. Of course, he cannot expect to be a Robert
Houdin... in a week, a month, or even year, because a wizard is not to be made in a day. -from the
Introduction From the basics of palming coins and pretending to shuffle cards to the sophisticated trickery of
convincing ladies to float in midair and spirits to manifest themselves, this charming book, first published in
1886, is a fascinating guide to the magician's stock in trade: his secrets. As slyly subversive in his day as
today's magic tell-alls Penn and Teller, the author reveals: . how to nail a "secretly" chosen playing card to
the wall . how to produce a shower of sweets from a borrowed handkerchief . how to produced a dozen
babies from a top hat . how to pass an egg into a bottle . how to change a bottle of wine into a vase of flowers
. how to "supernaturally" animate a skull . how to read minds . and more! The mysterious "Henri Garenne"
has disappeared into history, but his treatise remains a classic of stage magic, required reading for anyone
who wishes to amaze audiences with feats of prestidigitation. OF INTEREST TO: magic fans, amateur
conjurers
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From reader reviews:

Micheal Moore:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a wander,
shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or read a book titled The Art of Modern Conjuring? Maybe it
is being best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you
can cleverer than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have various other opinion?

Shanon Stephens:

This The Art of Modern Conjuring are usually reliable for you who want to be described as a successful
person, why. The reason of this The Art of Modern Conjuring can be one of many great books you must
have is giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed anyone with information that probably will
shock your prior knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever
your conditions at e-book and printed types. Beside that this The Art of Modern Conjuring giving you an
enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking that we realize it
useful in your day action. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Susan Tarin:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their free time with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or
picnic inside park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to fill
your current free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book can be option to fill your no cost time/ holiday. The
first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to try look for book,
may be the reserve untitled The Art of Modern Conjuring can be fine book to read. May be it is usually best
activity to you.

Clyde Traynor:

Many people spending their period by playing outside with friends, fun activity using family or just watching
TV all day every day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by reading through a book. Ugh, do
you think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It all right you
can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like The Art of Modern Conjuring
which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's observe.
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