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Honestly, I’m ready to take a step back from the Subs Club. Making the kink world a safer place for subs is
the sort of bandwagon I’d have boarded as an idealist in my early twenties, but now I’m a pragmatist in my
late twenties. I prefer to focus on adopting and raising a child.

But unexpected factors inevitably derail my plans. Like Drix Seger—attractive and the first genuine sadist
I’ve encountered. If I were not in the process of renouncing my masochistic ways and becoming the normal,
responsible potential father the adoption agency wants to see, Drix and I might do well together.

But he has a foolish name and belongs to a cult of vampyres, and I am quitting kink. So why does Drix’s
infatuation with blood and biting make me so hot I can’t think straight? And why, when he looks at me, does
he seem to see something beyond a basket case with a stick up my ass?

Can I start a new phase in my life without leaving part of myself behind? Please send help.

—Miles
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From reader reviews:

Margaret Stanley:

The book Pain Slut can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you
want. Exactly why must we leave the good thing like a book Pain Slut? Wide variety you have a different
opinion about book. But one aim this book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to
closer using your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you are
able to share all of these. Book Pain Slut has simple shape however you know: it has great and large function
for you. You can look the enormous world by open up and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Danny Saleem:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, paper, book,
and soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended for you is Pain Slut this book consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world
now. This specific book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The language styles that writer
use to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some exploration when he makes this book. That's
why this book suited all of you.

Curtis Hernandez:

Is it you who having spare time in that case spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Pain Slut can be the response, oh how comes? The new
book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this completely new era
is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

Larry Huff:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book has been rare? Why so
many query for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people likes
studying, not only science book and also novel and Pain Slut or perhaps others sources were given know-
how for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science e-book
was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those publications are helping them to put their
knowledge. In other case, beside science guide, any other book likes Pain Slut to make your spare time much
more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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