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How do you get from here to there? Where is there? Psychologist Colin Ellard demonstrates that navigating
through space is both complex and utterly fascinating. Beginning with the neurological and muscular
coordination involved in the simple act of reaching for an object, he then investigates our interaction with
space -- how near and distant landmarks, for example, are used differently in navigation. From the complex
behaviour of insects to the epic journeys of sea turtles, from the subtle knowledge of the environment
demonstrated by such famed navigators as the Inuit and South Pacific sailors to the conceptual worlds of
cyberspace, Where Am I? reveals just how deeply our unique relationship with space defines what it means
to be human.

But Ellard also takes his argument a step further to show that the uniquely human ability to visualize and
partition space has led to an increasing disconnection from the natural world. Architects and city planners, he
suggests, need to consider human behaviour when constructing human environments, and we all need to
recognize that we are part of, not isolated from, the space around us. Where Am I? is an absorbing,
compulsively readable study of the power of space in our lives.
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From reader reviews:

Victoria Schwan:

In other case, little men and women like to read book Where Am I. You can choose the best book if you love
reading a book. As long as we know about how is important the book Where Am I. You can add expertise
and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can
understand everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you will find yourself known.
About simple factor until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we can easily open a book as well
as searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel bored to go to the
library. Let's study.

Kevin Ortiz:

Book is usually written, printed, or created for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important thing to bring us around the world. Beside
that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A book Where Am I will make you to possibly be smarter.
You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But some of you think this
open or reading the book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they might be thought
like that? Have you searching for best book or appropriate book with you?

Shad Broussard:

This Where Am I are generally reliable for you who want to be described as a successful person, why. The
reason of this Where Am I can be on the list of great books you must have will be giving you more than just
simple reading through food but feed you with information that probably will shock your prior knowledge.
This book is usually handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions in e-book and
printed people. Beside that this Where Am I forcing you to have an enormous of experience such as rich
vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day action. So , let's
have it and revel in reading.

Craig Chivers:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Where Am I book written by well-
known writer who knows well how to make book which can be understand by anyone who else read the
book. Written in good manner for you, dripping every ideas and producing skill only for eliminate your
hunger then you still hesitation Where Am I as good book but not only by the cover but also with the
content. This is one e-book that can break don't judge book by its protect, so do you still needing one more
sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already told you so why you have to
listening to yet another sixth sense.
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